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CONTRACT IR-30849-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9904200                                         DBE GOAL:  5.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  23,172,000.00 
CALL: 190                 ROUTE: 25                                                  LAPORTE DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON SR 25 FROM 0.2 MILE EAST OF CR 400 WEST TO 0.11 MILE EAST 
                                 OF CR 100W 
                         COUNTY: CARROLL 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0918397  | RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION       | GOSHEN                       | $ 19,711,238.68 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-875-5183 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0997978  | PHEND & BROWN INC              | MILFORD                      | $ 19,912,966.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         574-658-4166 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 15,980,158.02 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   |        DBE  5.06% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1917625  | MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP       | COLUMBUS                     | $ 19,062,678.45 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         800-854-1830 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      | $ 18,664,690.53 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-3543170  | T J  LAMBRECHT CONSTRUCTION    | JOLIET                       | $ 19,496,750.50 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Illinois        815-726-7722 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT IR-33633-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902204                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  28,650,000.00 
CALL: 200                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM 9.6 MILES NORTH OF SR 64 TO 9.8 MILES 
                                 SOUTH OF US 50 
                         COUNTY: PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $  1,552,043.59 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | PW OF FURUTE MAINTENANCE COST  |                              | $    961,275.73 |    |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
            | SEC 0004 ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS  |                              | $          8.00 |    | X | 
            | FIXED PRICES                   |                              |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
32-0289822  | KOLB GRADING LLC               | ST CHARLES                   |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Missouri        636-441-0200 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
32-0289822  | KOLB GRADING LLC               | ST CHARLES                   | $  7,942,023.95 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Missouri        636-441-0200 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
32-0289822  | KOLB GRADING LLC               | ST CHARLES                   | $ 18,549,922.10 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Missouri        636-441-0200 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1385672  | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | COLUMBUS                     |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-372-8441 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1385672  | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $  8,706,567.00 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-372-8441 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1385672  | FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC      | COLUMBUS                     | $ 17,187,891.00 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-372-8441 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $  7,937,643.15 |R   | X |        AWARD PENDING * 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   |(SEC 2+3+4 = $24,639,003.25) 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1875662  | CRIDER & CRIDER INC            | BLOOMINGTON                  | $ 16,701,352.10 |R   | X |        AWARD PENDING * 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-336-4452 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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CONTRACT IR-33633-A       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902204                                         DBE GOAL:  6.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD AND BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION                    ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $  28,650,000.00 
CALL: 200                 ROUTE: 69                                                  VINCENNES DISTRICT 
CONTINUED              LOCATION: ON PR 69 FROM 9.6 MILES NORTH OF SR 64 TO 9.8 MILES 
                                 SOUTH OF US 50 
                         COUNTY: PIKE 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1878024  | RAGLE INC                      | NEWBURGH                     |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-853-9558 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1878024  | RAGLE INC                      | NEWBURGH                     | $  8,643,799.30 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-853-9558 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1878024  | RAGLE INC                      | NEWBURGH                     | $ 17,093,079.09 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-853-9558 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  |      NO BID     |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $  8,021,335.80 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $ 16,938,656.20 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      |      NO BID     |R   |   |         
            | SEC 0001 HMA OPTION            | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      | $  8,925,072.33 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0002 PCCP OPTION           | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
36-2231526  | WALSH CONSTRUCTION COMPANY     | LAPORTE                      | $ 18,639,925.25 |R   |   | 
            | SEC 0003 COMMON ITEM           | Indiana         219-324-4320 |                 |    |   |         
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A PAVEMENT OPTION SECTION (0001 OR 0002), THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT WORTH  
COST, AND THE COMMON ITEMS (SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002, SECTION 0003, AND SECTION 0004. 
(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' SECTION BIDS SHOWN DO NOT INCLUDE SECTION 0004.) 
 
*ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE. 
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CONTRACT R -29853-B       FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0501208                                         DBE GOAL:  2.00 
                    DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE                                   ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE:  $   4,281,000.00 
CALL: 260                 ROUTE: I-64                                                SEYMOUR DISTRICT 
                       LOCATION: ON I-64 FROM 0.53 MILE WEST OF SR 135 TO 0.16 MILE WEST OF 
                                 SR 62/SR 64 INTERCHANGE 
                         COUNTY: FLOYD        HARRISON 
   CODE                  BIDDER                  ADDRESS        PHONE           AMOUNT OF BID  TYPE LOW        REMARKS 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-0626844  | J H RUDOLPH & COMPANY          | EVANSVILLE                   | $  4,496,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-476-4921 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-1487672  | MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING  | NEW ALBANY                   | $  4,072,000.00 |R   |   | 
            |                                | Indiana         812-941-7895 |                 |    |   | 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
35-2040801  | GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION | CLARKSVILLE                  | $  3,988,000.00 |R   | X |        AWARD 
            |                                | Indiana         812-282-1349 |                 |    |   |        DBE  2.16% 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
 
 


